BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Fertilizers

Supoliers: D & K Products Pace Supply River City Turf & Ornamental| SiteOne Landscape Supply Zimco Supply Co.
pP ' Des Moines, IA Fairfax, 1A Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH Clive, 1A
Item #| Qty |Requested Analysis / Description Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid

SGN 220+ (fairway grade)

1 278 |32-3-10; 50-75% poly SCU 30-0-5; 50% NSN 32-3-10 55% PCSCU 34-0-5 50% SCU 32-0-10; 75% PolyPlus 2FE 32-5-7 50% PCSCU
U.l. / SGN: 220 220 220 240 220
Cost of Nitrogen/lb: 0.900 | $ 37.84 $ 1.11 0.98
Unit Price: 13.40 | $ 16.91| $ 16.50 | $ 17.75 15.70
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 3,725.20| $ 4,700.98 | $ 4,587.00| $ 4,934.50 4,364.60
2 13 |21-3-21; 75% Uflex 21-0-21; 75% Uflexx 21-3-21 75% ExN 19-0-19 75% SCU, SOP 21-3-2|\1A,O7F?;’/SogslyPlus no bid
U.l. / SGN: 220 220 220 240
Cost of Nitrogen/Ib: 1.490 | $ 25.540 $ 1.84
Unit Price: 15.60 | $ 16.44| $ 21.00 | $ 19.31
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 202.80 | $ 213.72( $ 273.00| $ 251.03
3 | 32 |13-26-5; SCU, 100% amm sulfate no bid 13-26-5 AM 14-24-9 33% SCU 18'24'156?,(/’?0?'3’”“5 no bid
U.l. / SGN: 220 220 240
Cost of Nitrogen/lb: $ 18.77 $ 2.13
Unit Price: $ 13.85| $ 1575 | $ 19.18
Rebate:
Extended Price: $ 443.20| $ 504.00| $ 613.76
4 20 [6-2-0; Fairway Grade Milorganite Milorganite 6-2-0 Greens Grade Milorganite 50 Ib Miorganite Classic 6-2-0 no bid
U.l. / SGN: 220 90 220
Cost of Nitrogen/lb: 3.070 | $ 99.33
Unit Price: 9.20 | $ 12.08| $ 1150 | $ 10.02
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 184.00 | $ 241.60| $ 230.00| $ 200.40
5 670 |33-0-5; 100%RXN/Uflexx; 2%fe MOP as specified 30-0-5 100% PCSCU SOP 34-0-5 50% SCU no bid 33-0-5 100% STN 2% FE
U.l. / SGN: 220 220 220
Cost of Nitrogen/lb: 0.850 | $ 29.52 0.85
Unit Price: 14.00 | $ 2032 $ 16.50 13.95
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 9,380.00 | $ 13,614.40| $ 11,055.00 9,346.50
6 121 |46-0-0; Uflexx or similar stabilization as specified as specified as specified Lesco Basic Nli}glt:gn 46-0-0 100% as specified
U.l. / SGN: 220 220 240
Cost of Nitrogen/Ib: 0970 | $ 39.96 $ 0.78 0.98
Unit Price: 2220 | $ 23.02| $ 2250 $ 17.83 22.50
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 2,686.20 | $ 2,785.42 | $ 272250 | $ 2,157.43 2,722.50




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Fertilizers

Suppliers: D & K Products Pace Supply River City Turf & Ornamental| SiteOne Landscape Supply Zimco Supply Co.
Des Moines, IA Fairfax, 1A Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH Clive, 1A
Item #| Qty |Requested Analysis / Description Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid
6.1 46-0-0; Uflexx - alternate 46-0-0 Spray grade urea
U.l. / SGN:
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:
Unit Price: $ 14.50
Rebate:
Extended Price: $ 1,754.50
Combination Fertilizers / Chemicals
18-0-4; 50% RXN or Uflexx; 43% 18-0-4; 40% RXN; .43% 18-0-4 50% Uflexx w/ .43% . Stonewall .43% 19-0-7 30% | 18-0-3 .42 Prodiamine; Nutri Life
7 200 |5 —— . . no bid .
barricade Barricade Barricade PolyPlus & Regain
U.l. / SGN: 220 220 240
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 1580 | $ 20.44 $ 168 | $ 1.62
Unit Price:| $ 1420 | $ 17.61 $ 1596 | $ 14.60
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:] $ 2,840.00| $ 3,522.00 $ 3,192.00| $ 2,920.00
8 400 20-0-8; with .067 Acelepryn XCU; 150- as specified 20-0-8 50% PCSCU w/ .067% 20-0-8 50% SCU; .067 Acelepryn .067% 20-0-5 75% 20-0-8 .67 Acelepryn; 50%
220 SGN; 50% XCU/Uflexx PCSCU Acelypryn Acelepryn PolyPlus PCSCU
U.l. / SGN: 220 220 220 240 220
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 2.780 | $ 12.94 $ 3.00[ $ 2.88
Unit Price:| $ 2780 | $ 3091] $ 30.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 28.80
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 11,120.00 | $ 12,364.00| $ 12,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 11,520.00
20-0-5 Lebenon 30% Mesa .67
8.1 Acelepryn
$ 30.55
$ 12,220.00
9 450 M Anderspn's grgnular fertilizer as specified 21-0-8 50% PC$CU w/ .20% 21-0-5 50% SCU: .2% mallet Lesco Merit .2% 14-0-0 30% no bid
with .2% Merit insecticide Merit PolyPlus
U.l. / SGN: 215 220 220 240
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 1.700 | $ 19.58 $ 2.47
Unit Price:| $ 1780 | $ 21.14( $ 1985 | $ 17.29
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:] $ 8,010.00| $ 9,513.00| $ 8,932.50| $ 7,780.50
10 26-0-5; 90% Duration with .15% as specified as specified no bid 16 bid 25-0-5 Lebenon 51%Mesa,100%
dimension & .058% Acelepryn Expo,.67Acelepryn,.167Dimension
U.l. / SGN: 220 220 220
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 4.800 | $ 8.18
Unit Price:| $ 62.20 | $ 63.50 $ 69.00
Rebate: 2% VGM

Usage rate per acre:

not provided

4 - 50# bags/acre




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Fertilizers

Suppliers: D & K Products Pace Supply River City Turf & Ornamental| SiteOne Landscape Supply Zimco Supply Co.
Des Moines, IA Fairfax, 1A Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH Clive, 1A
Item #| Qty |Requested Analysis / Description Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid
101 26-0-5; 90% Duration with .15% 25-0-5 Lebenon 51% Mesa, 100%
’ dimension & .058% Acelepryn Expo,.67Acelepryn,.167Dimension
U.l. / SGN: 145
Cost of Nitrogen/Ib:
Unit Price: $ 71.00
: : 30-0-10 Lebenon 100 % Meth. EX,
11 32-0-5, 81% Duration with .15% as specified as specified no bid no bid 100% Expo, .67 Acelepryn, .167
dimension & .058% Acelepryn Dimension
U.l. / SGN: 220 220 145
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 4.180 9.70
Unit Price:| $ 66.80 65.95 $ 79.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Usage rate per acre: not provided 4 - 50# bags/acre
SGN 75-120 (greens grade)
12 11 22:0-22, 100% nutralene (N release must as specified no bid as specified no bid no bid
be equal)
U.l. / SGN: 90 90
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 3.100
Unit Price:| $ 34.10 $ 35.75
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 375.10 $ 393.25
13 46 13-2-13; w/ Am Sulphate; 2% fe, minors as specified 1o bid 18-4-18 50% nutralene SOP + 14-2-14 E 97% AS FE 16 bid
(AGG) micros
U.l. / SGN: 100 100 100
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 4.940 $ 2.74
Unit Price:| $ 32.10 $ 31.00 | $ 19.16
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 1,476.60 $ 1,426.00 | $ 881.36
14 20 |10-20-20; 50% nutralene SOP/micros as specified no bid 10-18-22 50‘:/:1i21r,|(§rsalene SOP + no bid no bid
U.l. / SGN: 100 100
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 6.600
Unit Price:| $ 33.00 $ 32.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 660.00 $ 640.00
15 13 14-28-10; 50% nutralene (N release must as specified no bid 11-52-0 mini MAP 12-24-14 E 50% PolyPlus 3Mo 16 bid
be equal) SOP
U.l. / SGN: 100 100 100
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 4.630 $ 4.40
Unit Price:| $ 32.40 $ 32.00 | $ 26.38
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 421.20 $ 416.00 | $ 342.94




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Fertilizers

Suppliers: D & K Products Pace Supply River City Turf & Ornamental| SiteOne Landscape Supply Zimco Supply Co.
Des Moines, IA Fairfax, 1A Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH Clive, 1A
Item #| Qty |Requested Analysis / Description Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid
16 31 20-0-20; 50% Polymer coated (N release no bid 1o bid no bid 18-0-18 E 100% PolyPlus 3Mo 16 bid
must be equal) SOP
U.l. / SGN: 100
Cost of Nitrogen/Ib: $ 3.73
Unit Price: $ 29.85
Rebate:
Extended Price: $ 925.35
17 9 _'T'icgh:t/?/ ng'ires,?ff%’\l,\;:l DG 60% MU; 18-9-18 Contec DG no bid no bid as specified no bid
U.l. / SGN: 75
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 5.880 $ 3.94
Unit Price:| $ 52.90 $ 31.58
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 476.10 $ 284.22
18 15 |6-2-0; Greens Grade Milorganite Millorganite Greens Grade 6-2-0 Greens Grade Milorganite Greens Milorganite 6-20-0 E Grns Grd no bid
U.l. / SGN: 100 90 100
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 3.400 99.33
Unit Price:| $ 10.20 12.08| $ 13.50 | $ 10.02
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 153.00 181.20| $ 20250 $ 150.30
19 6 |0-0-50; Granular Potassium 0-0-50 SOP 0-0-51 Greens Grade 0-0-50 Greens £55 SRR, [LEEE (e no bid
100% SOP
U.l. / SGN: 200 90 100
Cost of Nitrogen/Ib: n/a n/a
Unit Price:| $ 27.00 3185 $ 2750 | $ 25.52
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 162.00 191.10 [ $ 165.00 | $ 153.12
20 32 Gypsu.m.; Calcium Products; SuperCal as specified as specified as specified Gypsum Fairw_ay Crown Pro 16 bid
So4 mini Series
U.l. / SGN: 100 n/a 100
Cost of Nitrogen/Ib: n/a n/a
Unit Price:| $ 7.50 750]| $ 9.75 1 % 6.18
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 240.00 240.00 | $ 312.00 | $ 197.76
21 16 zsgitrlé:j gLégi;ii?lcmm Products; as specified as specified as specified LescoLI;’rg(lel.s‘l[Z;(:]Igrmltlc no bid
U.l. / SGN: 100 n/a 100
Cost of Nitrogen/Ib: n/a n/a
Unit Price:| $ 7.50 6.25| $ 8.75 | $ 5.42
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 120.00 100.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 86.72




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Fertilizers

Suppliers: D & K Products Pace Supply River City Turf & Ornamental| SiteOne Landscape Supply Zimco Supply Co.
Des Moines, IA Fairfax, 1A Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH Clive, 1A
Item #| Qty |Requested Analysis / Description Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid
22 16 Hum?c; Calcium Products; SuperCal as specified as specified no bid Organic Gran. Soil conditioner no bid
Humic + Gypsum
U.l. / SGN: 220 n/a
Cost of Nitrogen/Ib: n/a n/a
Unit Price:| $ 16.00 | $ 16.50 $ 11.67
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 256.00 | $ 264.00 $ 186.72
Other
23 6 |0-0-50; Water Soluble as specified no bid as specified Lesco 0-0-50 100% SOP no bid
U.l. / SGN: n/a
Cost of Nitrogen/Ib: n/a
Unit Price:| $ 24.90 $ 30.00 | $ 25.52
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 149.40 $ 180.00 | $ 153.12
24 30 |28-8-18; Sprayable fertilizer 28-8-18; Nutriculture Bent Special as specified 20-20-20 w/ micros; 25Ib Macron 28-7-14; 25 Ib bag no bid
U.l. / SGN: n/a n/a
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 3.330 | $ 23.38 $ 2.31
Unit Price:| $ 2330 | $ 23.95( $ 26.00 | $ 32.46
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 699.00 | $ 71850| $ 780.00| $ 973.80
Pricing firm for full season of contract? Yes No No Yes Yes
If no, date for mid-season price review: July 30th not specified
Lead time for delivery: 2-3 days 7-10 days 1-3 days 2-7 days 1 week - 10 days
Certified local business? Yes Yes No Yes No
Accept pcard? Yes Yes No Yes Yes
Quick pay discount: None None None None None




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Chemicals

Suppliers: D & K Products Pace Supply River City Turf & Ornamental |SiteOne Landscape Supply Zimco Supply Co.
Des Moines, IA Fairfax, IA Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH Clive, IA
Item # [Product Name/Description UEZ;'e Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing
PHOSPHITE
1 |0-0-30 Stress Phiter Fungicide 19 as specified no bid Phyte Off Lesco Greenflo Phyte 0-0-18 no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 2-3 0z 1-3 0z 30z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 96.00 $ 96.85 | $ 98.16
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 1,824.00 $ 1,840.15 | $ 1,865.04
FUNGICIDES
2 |Torque Fungicide 4 Tebuconazole Tebuconazole Tebuconazole QualiPro Tebuconazole 36% no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal .6 0z .6 0z .6 0z .6 0z
Package Size: 5x1 gal 5 x 1 gallon gallon 5x1 gal
Price per Package: 260.00 331.65| $ 44.00 | $ 280.45
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 208.00 26532 | $ 176.00 | $ 224.36
3 |Daconil Flowable Weatherstik 17.5 Chlorothanil 720 Echo 720 Echo 720 Syngenta Daconil Action Dac. Weatherstick
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal 2-5.5 0z 2-5.50z 2-5.50z 4-54 oz
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2 x 2.5 gallon 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 160.00 22820 | $ 209.75 | $ 384.00 305.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 560.00 798.70 | $ 734.13 | $ 1,344.00 1,067.50
4 ProStar 1 as specified ProStar 70 WG no bid as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 1.5-4.5 0z 1.5-4.5 0z 1.5-3 0z
Package Size: 4x3 Ibs 4x3 Ibs 4x3 lbs
Price per Package: 688.00 812.64 $ 645.44
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 688.00 812.64 | $ - $ 645.44
5 Renown 10 as specified as specified no bid as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| gal 2.5-450z 2.5-450z 2.5-45 0z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 1,030.00 1,178.72 $ 1,030.00 1,030.00
Rebate: none
Extended Price: 2,060.00 235744 | $ - $ 2,060.00 2,060.00
6 |Tartan 2 as specified as specified no bid as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 1-2 0z 1-20z 1-2 0z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 1,980.00 2,216.76 $ 1,980.00
Rebate: none
Extended Price: 3,960.00 443352 | $ - $ 3,960.00




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Chemicals

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Pacg Supply River City T_urf & Ornamental |SiteOne Landscape Supply Zimco $upp|y Co.
Des Moines, IA Fairfax, IA Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH Clive, IA
Item # [Product Name/Description UEZ;'e Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing
7 Tourney 35 as specified as specified no bid as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| b .18-.37 oz 20z .18-.37 oz
Package Size: 4x5 |b bottle 4x5 |Ib bottle 4x5 Ib bottle 4x5 |b bottle
Price per Package: 2,771.00 16,402.60 $ 2,771.00 2,771.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 4,849.25 28,70455 | $ - $ 4,849.25 4,849.25
8 Instrata 6.5 as specified as specified no bid as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 2.75 0z 2.75-11 oz 2.75-6 oz
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 680.00 915.56 $ 800.00
Rebate: none
Extended Price: 4,420.00 5951.14 | $ - $ 5,200.00
9 |Banol (propamocarb) 3 Proplant Proplant Proplant SipcamAdvan Proplant Proplant
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 1.3-4 0z 1.3-4 0z 1.3-4 0z 1.3-50z
Package Size: 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal
Price per Package: 584.00 687.42 | $ 610.00 | $ 591.56 562.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 1,752.00 2,062.26 | $ 1,830.00 | $ 1,774.68 1,686.00
10 |Chlorothanil Zn Daconil Zn as specified Echo Zn Daconil ZN Daconil ZN
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 1.5-8 0z 350z 1.5-8 0z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 250.00 199.92 | $ 185.00 | $ 250.00 250.00
Rebate: none
Extended Price:
11 |Chlorothanil weatherstik 25 Echo Ultimate Daconil Ultrex Echo Ultimate Lesco Manicure Ultra Armor Tech C.L.T. 825
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 2-50z 2-550z 250z
Package Size: 4x5 Ibs 4x5 Ibs 4x5 Ibs 4x5 Ibs 4x5 Ibs
Price per Package: 124.00 21794 | $ 137.00 | $ 116.68 135.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 3,100.00 5,448.50 | $ 3,425.00 | $ 2,917.00 3,375.00
12 |lprodine 4 Chipco 26019 Chipco 26019 as specified Lesco 18 Plus no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 3-4 0z 3-8 0z 3-8 0z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 196.00 22990 | $ 199.75 | $ 190.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 784.00 919.60 | $ 799.00 | $ 760.00




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Chemicals

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Pacg Supply River City T_urf & Ornamental |SiteOne Landscape Supply Zimco $upp|y Co.
Des Moines, IA Fairfax, IA Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH Clive, IA
Item # [Product Name/Description UEZ;'e Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing
13 |Mefenoxam 4 as specified Mefenoxam 2 AG as specified as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs .5-10z .12 -01 0z .49-.98 oz
Package Size: 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal
Price per Package: 665.00 801.64 | $ 742.00 | $ 750.12
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 2,660.00 3,206.56 | $ 2,968.00 | $ 3,000.48
14 |Endorse 1 Clearys Affirm no bid no bid no bid no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 2.4/acre
Package Size: 3x11 Ibs
Price per Package: 680.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 680.00
15 |Propiconazole 6 Strider Propiconazole 14.3 as specified Lesco Spectator Ultra Armor Tech P.P.Z. 143
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 1-20z 5-40z 1-4 0z
Package Size: 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal
Price per Package: 121.00 148.00 | $ 13390 | $ 100.46 | $ 118.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 726.00 888.00 | $ 803.40 | $ 602.76 | $ 708.00
16 |Heritage 2 as specified as specified Endow (6lb Herit.=1.5g Endow) as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs .2-.4 0z 2-4 0z .38-.77 oz .2-4 0z
Package Size: 6x1 Ib 6x1 b 1 gal 6x1 Ib 6x1 Ib
Price per Package: 1,902.00 2,026.68 | $ 550.00 | $ 1,902.00 | $ 1,902.00
Rebate: none
Extended Price: 3,804.00 4,053.36 | $ 1,650.00 | $ 3,804.00 | $ 3,804.00
17 |Bayleton 50% WSP 2 as specified as specified no bid as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs .5-10z 5-20z .25-1 0z
Package Size: 4x1.375 |Ib 4x1.375 |b 550zx4x4
Price per Package: 465.00 572.04 $ 487.88
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 930.00 1,144.08 $ 975.76
18 |Secure (fluazinam) 2.5 as specified as specified no bid as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal 50z 50z .50z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 2,940.00 1,264.22 $ 2,940.00 | $ 2,940.00
Rebate: none
Extended Price: 1,470.00 632.11 $ 1,470.00 | $ 1,470.00




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Chemicals

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Pacg Supply River City T_urf & Ornamental |SiteOne Landscape Supply Zimco $upply Co.
Des Moines, IA Fairfax, IA Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH Clive, IA
Item # [Product Name/Description Uizge Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing
19 |Emerald (Boscalid) 2 as specified as specified no bid as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs .49Ib/acre 49 1b .13-.18 oz
Package Size: 10x.49 Ib 10x.49 Ib 10x.49 Ib 10x.49 Ib
Price per Package: 1,524.30 1,656.70 $ 1,524.30 1,524.29
Rebate: none
Extended Price: 3,048.60 3,313.40 $ 3,048.60 3,048.58
20 [Interface (Trifloxystrobin) 4 as specified as specified no bid as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs .3-.70z .3-.70z 4-7 oz
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 772.50 884.04 $ 772.50
Rebate: none
Extended Price: 3,090.00 3,536.16 $ 3,090.00
21 |Velista (penthropyrad) as specified no bid no bid as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: .3-.70z .3-.7 0z $198/22 oz
Package Size: 6 x22 0z 22 oz 6 x22 0z
Price per Package: 1,188.00 $ 198.00 1,188.00
Rebate: none
Extended Price: - -
22 |Xzemplar (Fluxapyroxad) as specified no bhid no bid as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 11.4 oz/acre .21-.26 oz
Package Size: 2x114 oz 11.4 0z 2x114 oz
Price per Package: 3,429.12 $ 197.22 3,429.12
Rebate: none
Extended Price:
23 |Fore 80 WP rainshield (Mancozeb) as specified no bid as specified Lesco Mancozeb DG no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 4-8 0z 4-8 oz
Package Size: 8x4x150z 8 (4x1.5Ib) 12 Ib x 4/cs
Price per Package: 403.20 $ 358.00 | $ 206.56
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
24 |Kabuto Fungicide SC (Isofetamid) as specified no bid no bid as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 21.78 oz/acre 4-5 0z
Package Size: 6 x21.78 21.78 oz 6x21.78 0z
Price per Package: 636.00 $ 106.00 636.00
Rebate: 2% VGM

Extended Price:




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Chemicals

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Pacg Supply River City T_urf & Ornamental |SiteOne Landscape Supply Zimco $upp|y Co.
Des Moines, IA Fairfax, IA Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH Clive, IA
Item # |Product Name/Description UEZ;'e Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing
25 |Chipco Signature (Aluminum Tris 80%) 1 as specified no bid no bid Lesco Prodigy Signature no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 4-8 oz
Package Size: 4x5.5Ib 4x551Ib
Price per Package: 616.00 $ 625.28
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 616.00 $ 625.28
26 |Spotrete Flowable (Thiram 44%) 1 as specified as specified no bid no bid no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs
Package Size: 2 x 2.5 gallon 2 x 2.5 gallon
Price per Package: 169.00 215.06
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 169.00 215.06
27 |Enclave 2 as specified as specified no bid as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 3-8 0z
Package Size: 2 x 2.5 gallon 2 x 2.5 gallon 2 x 2.5 gallon
Price per Package: 450.00 686.70 $ 580.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 900.00 1,373.40 $ 1,160.00
INSECTICIDES
28 [Imidacloprid 56 Zenith 75 WSB no bid Mallet Bandit Lesco 2F I.M.D. 75 Imidacloprid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 6.4 oz/acre .6 0z; 1 gal/5 acre
Package Size: 4x4x1.6 0z 4x4x1.6 0z 1 gallon (1280z = 5cs) 4x4x1.6
Price per Package: 61.00 $ 66.25 | $ 244.48 60.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 3,416.00 $ 3,710.00 | $ 2,738.18 3,360.00
29 Acelepryn Insecticide (Chorantrantiliprole as specified as specified no bid as specified as specified
chemical class)
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 8 oz/acre 8 oz/acre .046-.55 oz
Package Size: 4x64 oz 4x64 0z 4x64 oz 4x64 0z
Price per Package: 3,854.00 4,117.92 $ 3,854.00 3,854.00
Rebate: none
Extended Price:
30 gglsos))( 6.2g insecticide (Trichlorfon chemical as specified as specified as specified as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 3 1b/1000 3 1b/1000 3 1b/1000 3 1b/1000
Package Size: 30 Ib bag 30 Ib bag 30 Ib bag 30 Ib bag
Price per Package: 35.50 45.73 | $ 38.10 | $ 34.24
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Chemicals

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Pacg Supply River City T_urf & Ornamental |SiteOne Landscape Supply Zimco $upp|y Co.
Des Moines, IA Fairfax, IA Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH Clive, IA
Item # [Product Name/Description UEZ;'e Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing
31 Elr;vsa)unt Insecticide (Indoxacarb chemical 80 as specified no bid no bid as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqgft:|] oz 2 ozlacre .46-.275 oz
Package Size: 10 oz container 12 oz container 12 oz bottle
Price per Package: 81.40 $ 83.64 85.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 651.20 $ 557.60 566.67
32 |Tempo SC 900 ml 900 as specified as specified no bid as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:f ml 4-8 ml/acre .27-54 oz 4-8 ml/acre
Package Size: 900 ml 900 ml 900 ml
Price per Package: 144.00 170.82 $ 138.47
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 144.00 170.82 $ 138.47
33 |TREEage (4% Emamectin Benzoate) 4 Arbormectin-Treeage no bid no bid as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: L based on dbh based on DBH
Package Size: 8x1L 8x1L
Price per Package: 3,800.00 $ 3,952.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 1,900.00 $ 1,976.00
34 |Dylox 420 SL 3 as specified as specified no bid as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 4.6-6.9 oz 4.6-6.9 oz
Package Size: 2 x 2.5 gallon 2 x 2.5 gallon 2 x 2.5 gallon
Price per Package: 322.50 392.62 $ 344.68
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 967.50 1,177.86 $ 1,034.04
HERBICIDES
35 |[Baracade 4 FL herbicide 16 Evade 4L as specified Cavalcade 65 WDG Lesco Stonewall 65 WDG no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal 21 oz/acre .5-1.1 0z .185-.55 0z 1-1.25 Ib/acre
Package Size: 4X1 gal 4X1 gal 10 Ib bag 10 Ib bag
Price per Package: 280.000 677.12 | $ 98.90 | $ 119.97
Rebate: 2% VGM 100 Ib = 16 gal Baracade
Extended Price: 1,120.00 2,708.48 | $ 989.00 | $ 1,199.70
36 Rgundup Quick Pro; 73% Glyphosate; 2.9% 4 as specified as specified as specified (alternate Razor Burn Lesco Prosecutor Pro no bid
Diquat available for $66/gal)
Application Rate per 1000 sqgft:| cs 1.5 0z/1000 20z varies
Package Size: 4x6.8 b 6.8 |b jug 6.8 |b jug 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 298.00 84.20 | $ 7140 | $ 59.98
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 1,192.00 1,347.20 | $ 1,142.40




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Chemicals

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Pacg Supply River City T_urf & Ornamental |SiteOne Landscape Supply Zimco $upp|y Co.
Des Moines, IA Fairfax, IA Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH Clive, IA
Item # [Product Name/Description UEZ;'e Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing
37 |Pendimethalin 3.3 EC 6 as specified no bid as specified Lesco Pre-M 3.3 EC no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 1.3-1.80z 1.8 0z-3.6 0z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 168.75 $ 17475 | $ 143.98
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 1,012.50 $ 1,048.50 | $ 863.88
38 [Tenacity 3 as specified as specified no bid as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| gal .11-.18 oz .11-.18 oz 5-8 oz/acre
Package Size: 4 gal/case 4 gal/case 4 gal/case
Price per Package: 3,044.00 2,875.80 $ 3,044.00
Rebate: none
Extended Price: 2,283.00 2,156.85 $ 2,283.00
39 [Bensumec 4lf 17.5 as specified as specified as specified as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal 5.6-7.3 0z 5.6-7.3 0z 5.6-7.3 0z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 540.00 659.09 | $ 590.00 | $ 507.30
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 1,890.00 2,306.82 | $ 2,065.00 | $ 1,775.55
40 |Dow Dimension as specified no bid as specified as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: .28-.55 .28-.55 oz
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: $ 1,050.00 $ 1,157.50 | $ 1,050.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ - $ - $ .
41 |Drive XLR8 2 as specified as specified as specified as specified Quinclorac 1.5
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 1.45 0z 1.450z 1.45 oz
Package Size: 4x64 oz 4x64 oz 4x64 oz 4x64 oz 4x64 oz
Price per Package: $ 248.00 29499 | $ 242.00 | $ 243.12 221.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 496.00 589.98 | $ 484.00 | $ 486.24 442.00
42 |Quincept 2 as specified no bid as specified no bid no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 2-30z
Package Size (2x2.5 gallon): 2 x 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon
Price per Package: $ 510.00 $ 257.50
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 1,020.00 $ 1,030.00




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM

TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Chemicals

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Pacg Supply River City T_urf & Ornamental |SiteOne Landscape Supply Zimco $upp|y Co.
Des Moines, IA Fairfax, IA Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH Clive, IA
Item # [Product Name/Description UEZ;'e Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing
43 |Confront 1 as specified as specified as specified as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs .75 02/1000 .37-74 0z .37-.74 oz
Package Size (30 gallon): 4 x 1 gallon 4 x 1 gallon 4 x 1 gallon 4 x 1 gallon
Price per Package: $ 512.00 620.44 | $ 47560 | $ 480.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 512.00 620.44 | $ 47560 | $ 480.00
44 |Prokoz Vessel Trimec 1 as specified Vessel Triplet 3-Way Selective Lesco no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 1.1-150z 150z 150z
Package Size (2x2.5 gallon): 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: $ 115.00 152.84 | $ 121.25 | $ 98.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 115.00 152.84 | $ 121.25 | $ 98.00
45 |Prokoz Vessel Trimec 30 as specified Vessel Triplet 3-Way Selective Lesco no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal 1.1-150z 150z 150z
Package Size (30 gallon): 30 gal 30 gal 30 gal 30 gal
Price per Package: $ 675.00 888.06 | $ 71250 | $ 525.79
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 675.00 888.06 | $ 71250 | $ 525.79
46 |Prokoz Vessel Trimec 55 as specified Vessel Triplet 3-Way Selective Lesco no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal 1.1-150z 150z 150z
Package Size (55 gallon): 55 gal 55 gal 55 gal 55 gal
Price per Package: $ 1,237.50 1,602.00 | $ 1,289.75 | $ 963.95
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 1,237.50 1,602.00 | $ 1,289.75 | $ 963.95 no bid
47 |Roundup Pro (41% Glyphosate) Prokoz Glyphosate Pro Glyphosate Pro 41% Glyphosate Lesco Prosecutor Pro Buckaneer 41% Glyphosate
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 1.5-3 0z 2/3-13 ozs per fallon varies
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: $ 87.00 9094 | $ 6495 | $ 59.98 59.50
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
48 |Quick Silver 5 as specified as specified no bid as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| bottle .021-.154 oz 1.5-3 0z .9-1.5 0z
Package Size: 8 0z bottle 8 0z bottle 8 0z bottle
Price per Package: $ 126.00 154.19 $ 121.21
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 630.00 770.95 $ 606.05




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Chemicals

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Pacg Supply River City T_urf & Ornamental |SiteOne Landscape Supply Zimco $upp|y Co.
Des Moines, IA Fairfax, IA Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH Clive, IA
Item # [Product Name/Description UEZ;'e Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing
49 |Preen (Trifluralin) 2 as specified no bid Treflan .5G Lebanon Preen Plus no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| drums .31-.61 oz
Package Size:| =34lb 17 b drum 40 Ib bag 20 |b drum
Price per Package: 41.00 $ 28.80 | $ 30.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 82.00 $ 2448 | $ 25.50
50 |Dicamba Vessel (2-4-D, MCPP) Vessel Trimec no bid Triplet 3-Way Selective Lesco no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 1.1-150z 150z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 115.00 $ 121.25 | $ 98.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: - $ - $ =
51 [Dicamba Vessel (2-4-D, MCPP) 2 Vessel Trimec no bid Triplet 3-Way Selective Lesco no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| drums 1.1-150z 150z
Package Size: 55 gal drum 55 gal 55 gal
Price per Package: 1,237.50 $ 1,289.75 | $ 963.95
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 2,475.00 $ 2,579.50 | $ 1,927.90
52 |Q4 Plus as specified as specified as specified as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 30z 30z
Package Size: gallon gallon gallon gallon
Price per Package: 99.40 11948 | $ 104.00 | $ 95.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: - $ - $ >
53 |Q4 Plus 1 as specified as specified as specified as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| drum 3oz 30z
Package Size: 30 gallon drum 30 gallon drum 30 gallon drum 30 gallon drum
Price per Package: 2,940.00 3,37325 | $ 2,970.00 | $ 2,640.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 2,940.00 3,373.25 | $ 2,970.00 | $ 2,640.00
54 |Tordon RTU (Streets Maintenance) as specified as specified as specified as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: ready to use varies
Package Size: 1 qt bottle 1 gt bottle 1 gt bottle 1 gt bottle
Price per Package: 14.00 1720 | $ 1298 | $ 12.37
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ - $ >




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM

TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Chemicals

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Pacg Supply River City T_urf & Ornamental |SiteOne Landscape Supply Zimco $upp|y Co.
Des Moines, IA Fairfax, IA Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH Clive, IA
Item # [Product Name/Description UEZ;'e Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing
55 [Sahara DG (Streets Maintenance) Mojave 70 EG as specified as specified Alligara Mojave 70 EG Mojave
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 5-10 Ibs/acre 10 Ib/acre 5-10 Ib/acre
Package Size: 5 |b bag 10 Ib bag 10 Ib bag 10 Ib bag 10 Ib bag
Price per Package: 45.90 139.05 | $ 135.00 | $ 96.00 112.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ - $ - $ - -
GROWTH REGULATORS
56 |Trim It 2 SC (Paclobutrazol) 1 Pac-Low no bid Tide Paclo 25C Tide Paclo 25C PAC 223 A.T.
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal .14-74 oz 6-32 oz/acre
Package Size: 4X1 gal 4x1 gal 4x1 gal 4X1 gal
Price per Package: 712.00 $ 750.00 | $ 742.56 756.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 178.00 $ 18750 | $ 185.64 189.00
57 |Proxy growth regulator 25 as specified as specified Ethephom 2 Ethephon 25L no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| gal 50z 50z
Package Size: 2.5 gal cont. 2.5 gal cont. 2.5 gal cont. 2.5 gal cont.
Price per Package: 72.50 100.63 | $ 46.25 | $ 69.81
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 725.00 1,006.30 | $ 462.50 | $ 698.10
58 [Trinexapac Ethyl 3 T-NEX; 1 AQ Primo Max Groom T-Nex PER 113 A.T.
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal .25-1.5 oz varies .125-1 oz
Package Size: 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal
Price per Package: $ 228.00 663.83 | $ 242.00 | $ 234.40 260.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 342.00 995.75 | $ 363.00 | $ 351.60 390.00
59 |Legacy plant growth regulator as specified as specified no bid as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 50z 50z 5-22 oz
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: $ 1,900.00 2,127.14 $ 1,900.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
AQUATICS
60 [Aquatic Blue pond dye 20 True Blue no bid as specified Admiral Liquid Aquatic no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| gal 1 gal/4 acre ft
Package Size: 4 x 1 gallon 4X1 gal 4x1 gal
Price per Package: $ 148.00 $ 102.00 | $ 153.08
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 740.00 $ 510.00 | $ 765.40




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Chemicals

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Pacg Supply River City T_urf & Ornamental |SiteOne Landscape Supply Zimco $upp|y Co.
Des Moines, IA Fairfax, IA Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH Clive, IA
Item # [Product Name/Description UEZ;'e Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing
61 [Copper Sulfate 2 as specified as specified as specified - fine / medium Applied Pro Copper Sulfate no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| bags various .67-5.32 Ib/acre ft
Package Size: 50 Ib bag 50 Ib bag 50 Ib bag 15 Ib bag
Price per Package: 98.00 153.98 $80 fine / $90 medium 47.90
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 196.00 307.96 $160 fine / $180 medium 319.33
62 |Aqua Sweep (2-4-D, Triclopyc) 15 as specified as specified as specified as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 1-2 oz 1-2 oz 1-1.3 0z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 197.50 240.70 | $ 212.50 210.00 196.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 296.25 361.05] $ 318.75 315.00 294.00
63 |Reward (diquat) 2.5 as specified no bid as specified Nufarm Diquat as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal 1-2 gal / acre
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 395.00 $ 314.75 116.32 395.00
Rebate: none
Extended Price: 197.50 $ 157.38 58.16 197.50
64 |Natural Pond Cleaner 2 no bid no bid Spectrum no bid no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs
Package Size: 24x8 oz
Price per Package: $ 385.00
Rebate:
Extended Price: $ 770.00
65 |[Clipper (Flumioxazin) as specified no bid as specified as specified no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 1 Ib / surface acre 6-12 oz/acre
Package Size: 1llb 1llb 5 Ib cont.
Price per Package: 131.00 $ 132.00 626.80
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
66 |Aquaneat (53.8% Glyphosate) as specified no bid Roundup Custom as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 1.5-3 0z 1.5 pts/acre
Package Size: 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon
Price per Package: 63.00 $ 46.25 47.22 57.25
Rebate: 2% VGM

Extended Price:




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM

TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Chemicals

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Pacg Supply River City T_urf & Ornamental |SiteOne Landscape Supply Zimco $upply Co.
Des Moines, IA Fairfax, IA Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH Clive, IA
Item # [Product Name/Description Uizge Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing
WETTING AGENTS
67 |Tri Cure AD (Polyepoxide) 60 as specified no bid no bid no bid no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal 4-6 oz
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 357.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 4,284.00
68 |Tri Cure Micro 62.5 as specified no bid no bid no bid no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal 8-12 oz
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 232.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 2,900.00
69 [Primer Select 15 as specified no bid no bid no bid no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal 4-6 0z
Package Size: 5 gal cont.
Price per Package: 298.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 894.00
70 |Fortify Forte no bid no bid no bid no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: .30z
Package Size: 6 X 64 0z
Price per Package: 1,440.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
SPRAY ADDITIVE
71 |[Cornbelt Premier 90 NIS 80 as specified FS Aqua Light no bid no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 1/4-1/2 pint / 100 Gal 1-4 pt/100 gal
Package Size: 6x1 gal 6x1 gal 2.5 gallon
Price Per Gallon: 82.50 1,556.00 | $ 33.75
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
72 |Defoamer Ignition Takedown as specified Knockdown Lesco Recede Anti-foam no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: varies
Package Size: 12x1 gt 12x1 qt 12x1 gt 12x1 gt
Price per Package: 102.00 85.80 | $ 186.00 | $ 118.08
Rebate: 2% VGM

Extended Price:




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM

TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Chemicals

Suppliers: D & K Products Pace Supply River City Turf & Ornamental |SiteOne Landscape Supply Zimco Supply Co.
’ Des Moines, IA Fairfax, IA Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH Clive, IA
Item # [Product Name/Description UEZ;'e Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing Bid Pricing
73 |New Balance PH adj. New Balance no bid no bid Lesco Conform PH Adjuster no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:
Package Size: 6x1 gal 6x1 gal
Price per Package: 180.00 $ 117.12
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
74 |Foam Marker Foam-a-lot no bid X Mark Foam Concentrate Lesco FoamMarker no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:
Package Size: 4x1 gal 4x1 gal 4x1 gal
Price per Package: 112.00 $ 176.00 | $ 110.52
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
75 |Tank Cleaner/Neutralizer Erase no bhid FS Clean Supreme LescoLol Tank Cleaner no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:
Package Size: 12 x1 gt 4x1 gal 12x21b
Price per Package: 162.00 $ 104.00 | $ 97.32
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
Pricing firm for full season of contract? Yes No Yes Yes Yes
If no, date for mid-season price review: July 30th, 2017
Lead time for delivery: 1-2 days 7 days 1-2 days 2-5 days 1 week - 10 days
Certified local business? Yes Yes No Yes No
Accept pcard? Yes Yes No Yes Yes
Quick pay discount: None None None None None




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Fertilizer by Vendor

Requested Analysis / Description

Product to be supplied

Price per bag

D & K Products

32-3-10; 50-75% poly SCU 30-0-5 50% NSN, SGN 220 $ 13.40
21-3-21; 75% Uflex 21-0-21 75% Uflexx, SGN 220 $ 15.60
6-2-0; Fairway Grade Milorganite 6-2-0; Milorganite SGN 220 $ 9.20
33-0-5; 100% RXN or Uflexx; 2% fe MOP 33-0-5 100% RXN 2% FE MOP, SGN 220 $ 14.00
46-0-0; Uflexx or similar stabilization 46-0-0 Uflexx, SGN 220 $ 22.20
18-0-4; 50% RXN or Uflexx; .43% barricade 18-0-4 40% RXN .43 Barricade, SGN 220 $ 14.20
20-0-8; with .67 Acelepryn XCU; 150-220 SGN; 50% XCU/Uflexx PCSCU 20-0-8; with .67 Acelepryn XCU; 50% XCU/Uflexx PCSCU, 220 $ 27.80
21-0-4; Anderson's granular fertilizer w/ .2% Merit insecticide 21-0-4; Anderson's granular w/ .2% Merit insecticide, 215 $ 17.80
26-0-5; 90% Duration with .15% Dimension & .058% Acelepryn 26-0-5; 90% Duration w/ .15% Dimension & .058% Acelepryn $ 62.20
32-0-5; 81% Duration with .15% Dimension & .058% Acelepryn 32-0-5; 81% Duration w/ .15% Dimension & .058% Acelepryn $ 66.80
22-0-22; 100% nutralene (N release must be equal) 21-0-22 Greens Grade 100% Nutralene $ 34.10
13-2-13; w/ Am Sulphate; 2% fe, minors (AGG) 13-2-13; w/ Am Sulphate; 2% fe, minors (AGG) $ 32.10
10-20-20; 50% nutralene SOP/micros 10-20-20 50% nutralene SOP Micros $ 33.00
14-28-10; 50% nutralene (N release must be equal) 14-28-10; 50% nutralene $ 32.40
18-9-18; Anderson's Nutri DG 60% MU; Tech w/ .3% Fe, .14% Mn 18-9-18 Contec DG $ 52.90
Gypsum; Calcium Products; SuperCal So4 mini Gypsum 100 SGN So4 mini $ 7.50
Humic; Calcium Products; SuperCal Humic SuperCal Humic $ 16.00
0-0-50; Water Soluble 0-0-50; Water Soluble $ 24.90
28-8-18; Sprayable fertilizer 28-8-18 Nutriculture Bent Special $ 23.30
Pace Supply

32-3-10; 50-75% poly SCU 32-3-10 55% PCSCU, SGN 220 $ 16.91
21-3-21; 75% Uflex 21-3-21 75% ExN, SGN 220 $ 16.44
13-26-5; SCU, 100% amm sulfate 13-26-5; SCU, 100% amm sulfate, SGN 220 $ 13.85
Gypsum; Calcium Products; SuperCal So4 mini Gypsum 100 SGN So4 mini $ 7.50
Pelletized Lime; Calcium Products; SuperCal 98G mini Pelletized Lime; SuperCal 98G mini $ 6.25
SiteOne Landscape Supply

20-0-20; 50% Polymer coated (N release must be equal) 18-0-18E 100% PolyPlus 3Mo SOP $ 29.85
6-2-0; Greens Grade Milorganite Milorganite 6-20-0 E Greens Grade $ 10.02

0-0-50; Granular Potassium

Lesco 0-0-50 100% SOP

$ 25.52




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM

TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Chemicals by Vendor

Product Name/Description

Product to be supplied

Package Size

Price Per Package

D & K Products

Phosphite 0-0-30 Stress Phiter Fungicide Stress Phiter 2x2.5 gal $96.00
Fungicides Daconil Flowable Weatherstik Chlorothanil 720 2x2.5 gal $160.00
Renown Renown 2x2.5 gal $1,030.00
Tartan Tartan 2x2.5 gal $1,980.00
Tourney Tourney 4x5 b bottle $2,771.00
Instrata Instrata 2x2.5 gal $680.00
Banol (propamocarb) Proplant 2x1 gallon $584.00
Mefenoxam Mefenoxam 2x1 gal $665.00
Endorse Clearys Affirm 3x11 Ib $680.00
Bayleton 50% WSP Bayleton WSP 4x1.375 |b $465.00
Secure (fluazinam) Secure 2x2.5 gal $2,940.00
Emerald (Boscalid) Emerald 10x.49 Ib $1,524.30
Interface (Trifloxystrobin) Interface 2 x 2.5 gallon $772.50
Velista (penthropyrad) Velista 6x22 0z $1,188.00
Xzemplar (Fluxapyroxad) Xzemplar 2x114 oz $3,429.12
Kabuto Fungicide SC (Isofetamid) Kabuto 6x21.78 $636.00
Chipco Signature (Aluminum Tris 80%) Chipco Signature 4x5.5 Ib $616.00
Spotrete Flowable (Thiram 44%) Spotrete Flowable 2x2.5 gal $169.00
Enclave Enclave 2x2.5 gal $450.00
Insecticides Acelepryn (Chorantrantiliprole chemical class) Acelepryn 4x64 0z $3,854.00
TREEage (4% Emamectin Benzoate) Arbormectin-Treeage 8§x1L $3,800.00
Dylox 420 SL Dylox 420 SL 2x2.5 gal $322.50
Herbicides Baracade 4 FL herbicide Evade 4L 4x1 gallon $280.00
Roundup Quick Pro; 73% Glyphosate; 2.9% Diquat Roundup Quick Pro 4x6.8 Ib jug $298.00
Tenacity Tenacity 4 gallcs $3,044.00
Dow Dimension Dow Dimension 2x2.5 gal $1,050.00
Quincept Quincept 2x2.5 gal $510.00
Sahara DG (Streets Maintenance) Mojave 70 eg 5 Ib bag $45.90
Growth Regulators |Trim It 2 SC (Paclobutrazol) Pac-Low 4 x 1 gallon $712.00
Trinexapac Ethyl T Nex 1 AQ 2x1 gal $228.00
Legacy plant growth regulator Legacy 2x2.5 gal $1,900.00
Aquatics Aqua Sweep (w-4-D, Triclopyc) Aqua Sweep 2x2.5 gal $197.50
Wetting Agents Tri Cure AD (Polyepoxide) Tricure AD 2x2.5 gal $357.00
Tri Cure Micro Tri Cure Micro 2x2.5 gal $232.00
Primer Select Primer Select 5 gallon cont. $298.00
Fortify Forte 6x64 0z $1,440.00
Spray Additive Cornbelt Premier 90 NIS 80 6x1 gallon $82.50
Defoamer Ignition Takedown 12x1 gt $102.00




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Chemicals by Vendor

Product Name/Description Product to be supplied Package Size Price Per Package
River City Turf & Ornamental
Fungicides Torque Fungicide (Cleary) Tebuconazole gallon $44.00
Chlorothanil Zn Echo Zn 2x2.5 gal $185.00
Heritage Endow (1 gallon = 4lb Heritage) 1 gallon $550.00
Growth Regulators |Proxy growth regulator Ethephom 2 2.5 gal cont. $46.25
Aquatics Aquatic Blue pond dye Aquatic Blue pond dye 4x1 gal $102.00
Copper Sulfate Copper Sulfate - fine/medium 50 Ib bag $80 fine / $90 med

Natural Pond Cleaner Spectrum 24 x 8 oz $385.00




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 5, 2017 AT 3:00 PM

TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1116-112) - Chemicals by Vendor

Product Name/Description

Product to be supplied

Package Size

Price Per Package

SiteOne Landscape Supply

Fungicides ProStar Prostar 4x3 Ib $645.44
Renown Renown 2x2.5 gal $1,030.00
Tartan Tartan 2x2.5 gal $1,980.00
Tourney Tourney 4x5 b bottle $2,771.00
Chlorothanil weatherstik Lesco Manicure Ultra 4x5 Ib $116.68
Iprodine Lesco 18 Plus 2x2.5 gal $190.00
Propiconazole Lesco Spectator Ultra 2x1 gal $100.46
Secure (fluazinam) Secure 2x2.5 gal $2,940.00
Emerald (Boscalid) Emerald 10x.49 Ib $1,524.30
Interface (Trifloxystrobin) Interface 2 x 2.5 gallon $772.50
Velista (penthropyrad) Velista 22 0z $198.00
Fore 80 WP rainshield (Mancozeb) Lesco Mancozeb DG 4x12 b $206.56
Kabuto Fungicide SC (Isofetamid) Kabuto 21.78 oz $106.00

Insecticides Imidacloprid Bandit Lesco 2F gallon $244.48
Acelepryn (Chorantrantiliprole chemical class) Acelepryn 4x64 0z $3,854.00
Dylox 6.2g (Trichlorfon chemical class) Dylox 6.2 G 30 Ib bag $34.24
Provaunt (Indoxacarb chemical class) Provaunt 12 oz $83.64
Tempo SC 900 ml Tempo SC 900 900 ml $138.47

Herbicides Pendimethalin 3.3 EC Lesco Pre-M 3.3 EC 2 x 2.5 gallon $143.98
Tenacity Tenacity 4 gallcs $3,044.00
Bensumec 4lIf Bensumec 4lf 2x2.5 gal $507.30
Dow Dimension Dow Dimension 2x2.5 gal $1,050.00
Drive XLR8 Drive XLR8 4x64 0z $243.12
Confront Confront 4x1 gal $480.00
Prokoz Vessel Trimec 3-Way Selective Lesco 2x2.5 gal $98.00
Prokoz Vessel Trimec 3-Way Selective Lesco 30 gal $525.79
Prokoz Vessel Trimec 3-Way Selective Lesco 55 gal $963.95
Roundup Pro (41% Glyphosate) Lesco Prosecutor Pro 2x2.5 gal $59.98
Quick Silver Quick Silver 8 0z bottle $121.21
Preen (Trifluralin) Lebanon Preen Plus 20 Ib drum $30.00
Dicamba Vessel (2-4-D, MCPP) 3-Way Selective Lesco 2x2.5gal $98.00
Dicamba Vessel (2-4-D, MCPP) 3-Way Selective Lesco 55 gal drum $963.95
Q4 Plus Q4 Plus gallon $95.00
Q4 Plus Q4 Plus 30 gallon drum $2,640.00
Tordon RTU (Streets Maintenance) Tordon RTU 1 gt bottle $12.37

Aquatics Reward (diquat) Nufarm Diquat 2x2.5 gal $116.32
Clipper (Flumioxazin) Clipper 5 |b cont. $626.80
Aquaneat (53.8% Glyphosate) Aquaneat 2.5 gallon $47.22

Spray Additives New Balance PH adj. Lesco Conform PH Adjuster 6x1 gallon $117.12
Foam Marker Lesco FoamMarker 4x1 gallon $110.52
Tank Cleaner/Neutralizer LescoLol Tank Cleaner 12x2 Ib $97.32




